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Across

2 St. Rose of Lima tells us, “Apart from the 
_____ there is no ladder by which we may get to 
Heaven (5)

4 God the Father permitted the suffering and 
Death of Jesus because of his immense _____ 
for us (4)

8 The Jewish method of capital punishment (7)

10 The translation for the Hebrew word for God, 
Yahweh (1,2)

11 Ironically, Judas betrays Jesus with a _____ 
under cover of dark (4)

12 A person who bears witness to the truth of 
faith even unto death (9)

15 The Sanhedrin felt that Jesus’ claim to be the 
_____ was blasphemous (7)

16 Jesus’ rule was not one of political or military 
power but one of humble _____ (7)

18 The chief priest and a member of the 
Sanhedrin (8)



20 Matthew reports that certain priests and 
Pharisees were concerned that Jesus’ disciples 
would _____ his body and claim he rose from 
the dead (5)

23 He betrays Jesus for thirty pieces of silver (5)

25 The place where Jesus is crucified (8)

26 Mary’s spiritual _____ extends to all of us 
(10)

28 The only one allowed to enter the holy of 
holies (4,6)

29 Although he know that Jesus is innocent, he 
fails to follow his conscience (6)

30 A strict Jewish sect that tried to perfectly 
follow the requirement of the Mosaic Law (9)

31 The Paschal Mystery is commemorated in a 
special way liturgically during _____ _____ 
(4,4)

32 The real authors and instruments of Jesus’ 
crucifixion (7)

Down

1 “… God greatly exalted him … that at the 
name of _____ every knee should bend…” Phil 
2:9-10 (5)

2 The passion narrative in John’s Gospel 
describes Jesus in _____ of the events (7)

3 The Eucharist Christ instituted at the Last 
Supper is the _____ of his sacrifice (8)

5 This sacrament initiates us into the Paschal 
Mystery (7)

6 The body of Jesus was released to Joseph of 
_____ who wraps it and places it in a new tomb 
(9)

7 A passerby who is pressed into carrying Jesus’ 
crossbeam (5)

9 The four separate accounts of the Passion of 
Christ are called the Passion _____ (10)

11 He was declared a “martyr of charity” by 
Pope John Paul II (5)

13 Christ took our sins to the cross, and like a 
New Adam, _____ us to the Father (11)

14 This was the charge against Jesus that the 
Sanhedrin brought to Pilate (12)

15 Our Lady, the Queen of Heaven and Earth, 
Ever Virgin, and Blessed Mother (4)

17 The Roman charge against Jesus is that he 
claimed to be the _____ _____ _____ _____ 
(4,2,3,4)

19 The leaders of the Jews are upset by Jesus’ 
criticism of their _____ (9)

21 “anointed one” (6)

22 A tipping point in the judgment of Jesus came 
when he predicted that the _____ would be 
destroyed and rebuilt in three days (6)

24 The seventy–one member supreme legislative 
and judicial body of the Jewish people (9)

27 Jesus commends the woman in Bethany who 
anoints him because it foreshadows the anointing 
of his body after his _____. (5)

29 Jesus predicts that this Apostle will deny him 
three times (5)


